
PARLIAMENT  OF  THE  DEMOCRATIC
SOCIALIST  REPUBLIC  OF

SRI  LANKA

RESETTLEMENT AUTHORITY (AMENDMENT)

————————

[Bill No. 231]

————————

Presented by the Minister of Resettlement on 08th March, 2013

(Published in the Gazette on February 26, 2013)

Ordered by Parliament to be printed

————————

to amend the  Resettlement Authority Act, No. 9 of 2007

A

BILL

PRINTED AT THE DEPARTMENT OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, SRI LANKA

TO BE PURCHASED AT THE GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS BUREAU, COLOMBO 5

Price : Rs. 3.00 Postage : Rs. 5.00

2-2d



STATEMENT OF LEGAL EFFECT

Clause 2 : This Clause amends section 32 of the Resettlement Authority Act, No. 09 of
2007 and the legal effect of the section as amended will be to extend the validity period of
the Act, from six years to nine years.



1Resettlement Authority (Amendment)

AN  ACT TO AMEND THE RESETTLEMENT AUTHORITY

ACT, NO. 9 OF 2007

L.D.—O. 41/2012.

BE it enacted by the Parliament of the Democratic Socialist
Republic of Sri Lanka as follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the Resettlement Authority
(Amendment) Act, No.     of 2013.

2. Section 32 of the Resettlement Authority Act, No. 09
of 2007 is hereby amended as follows:—

(1) by the substitution, for the words “six years”, of the
words “nine years”; and

(2) by the substitution, in the marginal note to that
section, for the words “six years”, of the words “nine
years”.

3. In the event of any inconsistency between the Sinhala
and the Tamil texts of this Act, the Sinhala text shall prevail.

Amendment
of section 32
of Act, No. 9
of 2007.

Short title.

5

10

Sinhala text
to prevail in
case of
inconsistency.



2 Resettlement Authority (Amendment)

Annual subscription of English Bills and Acts of the Parliament Rs. 885 (Local), Rs. 1,180
(Foreign), Payable to the SUPERINTENDENT, GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS BUREAU, DEPARTMENT OF

GOVERNMENT INFORMATION, NO. 163, KIRULAPONA MAWATHA, POLHENGODA, COLOMBO 05 before 15th
December each year in respect of the year following.


