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EXTRAORDINARY 

THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT, (CHAPTER 460)  
 

Notice under Section 7 
 

     My  No.:   11/3/3/1/18. 
 

 

Land Ministry's Ref. No.: LD/05/2008/MV/137.    
  

I, hereby give notice, under sub-Section (1) of Section 7 
of the Land Acquisition Act, as amended by the Land 
Acquisition (Amendment) Act, No. 28 of 1964, that the 
Government intends to acquire the following land which 
is required for a public purpose. 
 

Description of the Land to be acquired :  
 

Public purpose means the land Acquisition for the 
Moragahakanda and Kaluganga Development Project. 

 
 The lands described below, 0.0838 hectares in extent 

shown in sheet No. 191 of supplement 113 in Topo PP 20 
approved by Surveyor General dated on 23.01.2014, 
situated at E 402 C Weliwaranagolla Division of Laggala 
Pallesiya Pattuwa, Laggala-Pallegama Divisional 
Secretary's Division, Matale District, Central province. 

 
01. Lot No. 7277 
 

Name of Land: Digannawa Kelaya; Description of 
Land: Estate; Claiment: State; Possessed by: Pahala 
Gedara Swarnalatha of No. 88/4, Morathenna, Hatthota 
Amuna; Extent: 0.0838 Hectare. 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid land are hereby 

required to appear personally, or by agents before me at 
9.00 a.m. on the 16th July, 2014 at the Laggala Pallegama 
Divisional Secretariat.  

And further you are hereby requested to notify to me 
in writing (in duplicate) on or before the 09th July, 2014, 
the nature of their interests in the Land, the particulars of 
their claims for compensation for the acquisition of the 
said land, the amount of compensation and the details of 
the computation of such amount.  

 
 P. A. SARATHCHANDRA,  
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Laggala Pallegama. 
 
Divisional Secretariat, 
Laggala Pallegama. 
28th May, 2014. 
 
 

06 - 732/1 
_________________ 

 
THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT, (CHAPTER 460)  

 
Notice under Section 7 

 
     My  No.:   11/3/3/1/18. 

 
 

Land Ministry's Ref. No.: LD/05/2008/MV/137.    
  

I, hereby give notice, under sub-Section (1) of Section 7 
of the Land Acquisition Act, as amended by the Land 
Acquisition (Amendment) Act, No. 28 of 1964, that the 
Government intends to acquire the following land which 
is required for a public purpose. 
 

Description of the Land to be acquired :  
 

Public purpose means the Land Acquisition for the 
Moragahakanda and Kaluganga Development Project. 
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The lands described below, 0.2126 hectares in extent 
shown in sheet No. 190 of supplement 159 in Topo PP 20 
approved by Surveyor General dated on 23.01.2014, 
situated at E 402 C Weliwaranagolla Division of Laggala 
Pallesiya Pattuwa, Laggala-Pallegama Divisional 
Secretary's Division, Matale District, Central province. 

 
02. Lot No. 7275 
Name of Land: Weliwaranagolla alias Henyaya; 

Description of Land: Estate; Claiment: State; Possessed 
by: Pahala Gedara Swarnalatha of No. 88/4, Morathenna, 
Hatthota Amuna; Extent: 0.2126 Hectare. 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid land are hereby 

required to appear personally, or by agents before me at 
9.00 a.m. on the 16th July, 2014 at the Laggala Pallegama 
Divisional Secretariat. And further you are hereby 
requested to notify to me in writing (in duplicate) on or 
before the 09th July, 2014, the nature of their interests in 
the Land, the particulars of their claims for compensation 
for the acquisition of the said land, the amount of 
compensation and the details of the computation of such 
amount.  

 
 P. A. SARATHCHANDRA,  
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Laggala Pallegama. 
 
Divisional Secretariat, 
Laggala Pallegama. 
28th May, 2014. 
 
 

06 - 732/2 
_________________ 

 
 

THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT, (CHAPTER 460)  
 

Notice under Section 7 
 

     My  No.:   11/3/3/1/4. 
 

 

Land Ministry's Ref. No.: LD/05/2007/MV/154.    
  

I, hereby give notice, under sub-Section (1) of Section 7 
of the Land Acquisition Act, as amended by the Land 
Acquisition (Amendment) Act, No. 28 of 1964, that the 
Government intends to acquire the following land which 
is required for a public purpose. 
 

Description of the Land to be acquired :  
 
Public purpose means the land Acquisition for the 

Moragahakanda and Kaluganga Development Project. The 
lands described below, 0.1393 hectares in extent shown in 
sheet No. 193 of supplement 161 in Topo PP 20 approved 
by Surveyor General dated on 23.01.2014, situated at E 
402 C Weliwaranagolla Division of Laggala Pallesiya 

Pattuwa, Laggala-Pallegama Divisional Secretary's 
Division, Matale District, Central province. 

 
01. Lot No. 7283 
Name of Land: Weliwaranagolla; Description of Land: 

Estate and Open Waste Land; Claiment: State; Possessed 
by: L. Chaminda Jayasooriya of 6th Mile Post, Hatthota 
Amuna; Extent: 0.0323 Hectare. 

 
02. Lot No. 7284 
Name of Land: Weliwaranagolla; Description of Land: 

Road; Claiment: State; Extent: 0.0783 Hectare. 
 
03. Lot No. 7285 
Name of Land: Weliwaranagolla; Description of Land: 

Estate and Open Waste Land; Claiment: State; Possessed 
by: A. G. Piyasena of 6th Mile Post, Hatthota Amuna; 
Extent: 0.0287 Hectare. 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid land are hereby 

required to appear personally, or by agents before me at 
9.00 a.m. on the 16th July, 2014 at the Laggala Pallegama 
Divisional Secretariat. And further you are hereby 
requested to notify to me in writing (in duplicate) on or 
before the 09th July, 2014, the nature of their interests in 
the Land, the particulars of their claims for compensation 
for the acquisition of the said land, the amount of 
compensation and the details of the computation of such 
amount.  

 

 P. A. SARATHCHANDRA,  
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Laggala Pallegama. 
 
Divisional Secretariat, 
Laggala Pallegama. 
28th May, 2014. 
 
 

06 - 732/3 
_________________ 

 
THE LAND ACQUISITION ACT, (CHAPTER 460)  

 
Notice under Section 7 

 
     My  No.:   11/3/3/1/20. 

 
 

Land Ministry's Ref. No.: LD/05/2009/MV/135.    
  

I, hereby give notice, under sub-Section (1) of Section 7 
of the Land Acquisition Act, as amended by the Land 
Acquisition (Amendment) Act, No. 28 of 1964, that the 
Government intends to acquire the following land which 
is required for a public purpose. 
 

Description of the Land to be acquired :  
 

Public purpose means the land Acquisition for the 
Moragahakanda and Kaluganga Development Project. 
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The lands described below, 0.4282 hectares in extent 
shown in sheet No. 192 of supplement 160 in Topo PP 20 
approved by Surveyor General dated on 23.01.2014, 
situated at E 402 C Weliwaranagolla Division of Laggala 
Pallesiya Pattuwa, Laggala-Pallegama Divisional 
Secretary's Division, Matale District, Central province. 

 
01. Lot No. 7280 
Name of Land: Weliwaranagolla Henyaya Idama; 

Description of Land: Estate; Claiment: State; Possessed 
by: Pahala Gedara Nandasena of No. 88/4, Morathenna, 
Hatthota Amuna; Extent: 0.4282 Hectare. 

 
All persons interested in the aforesaid land are hereby 

required to appear personally, or by agents before me at 
9.00 a.m. on the 16th July, 2014 at the Laggala Pallegama 

Divisional Secretariat. And further you are hereby 
requested to notify to me in writing (in duplicate) on or 
before the 09th July, 2014, the nature of their interests in 
the Land, the particulars of their claims for compensation 
for the acquisition of the said land, the amount of 
compensation and the details of the computation of such 
amount.  

 

 P. A. SARATHCHANDRA,  
 Divisional Secretary, 
 Laggala Pallegama. 
 
Divisional Secretariat, 
Laggala Pallegama. 
28th May, 2014. 
 
 

06 - 732/4 
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