
w;s úfYI

wxl 2423$35 - 2025 fmnrjdß ui 15 jeks fikiqrdod - 2025'02'15
No. 2423/35  -  saturday,   february  15, 2025

EXTRAORDINARY

Y%S ,xld m%cd;dka;%sl iudcjd§ ckrcfha .eiÜ m;%h

The Gazette of the Democratic Socialist Republic of Sri Lanka

(Published by Authority)

PART I : SECTION (I) — GENERAL
Government Notifications

1A- G  43751 - 06 (02/2025) 
This Gazette Extraordinary can be downloaded from www.documents.gov.lk

Mod/def/ hrm/01/AMD/REG.

L. D.–B 16/2016.
The  navy  act  (Chapter 358)

regulations made by the Minister of Defence under section 161 of the Navy Act, (Chapter 358).

	 Anura Kumara Dissanayake,
	 Minister of Defence.

Colombo,
12th January, 2025.

Regulations

   T   he Sri Lanka Navy Women's  Service Regulations, 1989, Published in Gazette Extraordinary No. 799/7 of December 
27, 1993 are hereby amended as follows:-

	 (1)	I n regulation 16 –

	 (a)	 by the substitution in paragraph (c) for the words “at the age of forty five years.”, of the words “at the age of 
fifty five (55) years.”;



I fldgi ( ^I& fPoh - YS% ,xld m%cd;dka;s%l iudcjd§ ckrcfha w;s úfYI .eiÜ m;%h - 2025'02'15
Part I : Sec. (I) - GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY OF THE DEMOCRATIC SOCIALIST REPUBLIC OF SRI LANKA - 15.02.2025

2A

PRINTED AT THE DEPARTMENT OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,  SRI LANKA.

	 (b)	 by the repeal of paragraph (e) and the substitution therefor of the following:-

        “(e)  A  commissioned officer who retires from service may be transferred to the Regular Naval Reserve 
and retained until she reaches the age of Sixty (60) years, or such shorter period as may be determined by 
the Commander of Navy,”.

	 (2)	I n the proviso to regulation 29 –

	 (a)	 by the repeal of paragraph (a) and the substitution therefore of the following:-

“(a)  the original enlistment Period of a woman Sailor shall not exceed fifteen (15) years and after that she 
may be discharged:

       Provided however, if any woman sailor has been enlisted for a particular profession or has been 
undergone a special training, such woman sailor may not be allowed to retire upon completion of the 
fifteen years service period if the Commander of Navy is of the opinion that such retirement is detrimental  
to the interest of Sri Lanka Navy,";

	 (b)	 by the substitution in paragraph (b) for the words “twenty years:”, of the words and figures “twenty two (22) 
years:”.

	 (c)	 by the substitution in paragraph (c) for the words “twenty years:”, of the words and figures “twenty two years 
(22)” ;

	 (3)	 by the repeal of regulation 37.

EOG 02 - 0134


